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Descripción
La conferencia abordará el aprendizaje estadístico y sus mecanismos subyacentes desde el
comportamiento hasta la neurociencia, en varios dominios como el lenguaje, la música, la visión y la
audición, con datos de participantes adultos, el desarrollo, las diferencias individuales, el modelado
computacional y las especies no humanas. La conferencia contará con oradores invitados, charlas
regulares, mesas redondas y sesiones de pósteres.

Objetivos

Promover, a través de charlas y simposios, el intercambio de ideas en el campo del aprendizaje
estadístico entre expertos internacionales de diferentes disciplinas.

Compartir los resultados obtenidos a través de la investigación llevada a cabo en esta área.

Construir acuerdos de trabajo entre expertos del País Vasco y expertos internacionales.

Consolidar a San Sebastián como el punto de encuentro clave para los investigadores e investigadoras
internacionales.

Dar cuerpo a esta área tan innovadora y pionera.

Colaboradores específicos del curso

https://www.bcbl.eu/?lang=es
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Dirigido por:

Manuel Carreiras

BCBL - Basque Center on Cognition, Brain and Language

Manuel Carreiras is the scientific director of the BCBL (Basque Center on Cognition, Brain and
Language, Donostia-San Sebastián, Spain) that was awarded in 2015 the “Severo Ochoa” label of
excellence for a period of 4 years starting in 2016. He is also IKERBASQUE research professor,
Honorary Professor of the University College of London (UCL), and Distinguished Researcher of the
University of the Basque Country (UPV/EHU). His research focuses on reading, bilingualism and second
language learning. He is the editor in chief of Frontiers in Language Sciences, and associated editor of
Language, Cognition, and Neuroscience and of Brain and Language. He has published more than 250
papers in high impact journals in the field. His research has been funded by different research agencies.
He was the coordinator of the Consolider-Ingenio2010 grant entitled COEDUCA, and Principal
Investigator of the ERC (European Research Council) advanced grant entitled Bi-Literacy and of a
Health Research 2018 La Caixa Foundation grant entitled DysThal. He has been recipient of the Euskadi
Research prize 2015, and of the Spanish National Research prize in Social Sciences Pascual Madoz,
2019.



5

Profesorado

Lori Holt

Carnegie Mellon University

Lori L. Holt is a Professor of Psychology at Carnegie Mellon University and is affiliated with Pittsburgh’s
Center for the Neural Basis of Cognition. She has been a member of the Department of Psychology and
the Dietrich College of Humanities and Social Sciences at Carnegie Mellon University since earning her
Ph.D. from the University of Wisconsin-Madisonin 1999. Dr. Holt is the recipient of a 21st Century
Scientist Award for Mind, Brain and Behavior from the James S. McDonnell Foundation and her research
has been recognized by awards from her peers at the Acoustical Society of America, the American
Speech, Language and Hearing Association and the National Organization for Hearing Research. In
2007, the Association for Psychological Science named her a Rising Star in Psychology. In 2013, Dr. Holt
was awarded the Troland Research Award from the National Academy of Sciences. Dr. Holt is an expert
in auditory cognitive neuroscience.

Simon Kirby

Centre for Language Evolution, University of Edinburgh

My work concerns the origin and evolution of language, and the unique ways that culture and biology
interact in our species. I have pioneered a new approach to understanding cultural evolution of
behaviours such as language which we call Iterated Learning. A number of research groups around the
world - in addition to my own - are now studying Iterated Learning using techniques as diverse as
mathematical modelling, computational simulation, and psychological experiments. My view is that a
complete understanding of human nature requires an account of the complex interactions between
individual learning, cultural transmission and biological evolution in human populations. In addition, I
pair my scientific research with artistic output by collaborating with sculptors and musicians to create
interactive installations exploring issues of communication and cultural evolution in a socially and
informationally promiscuous world. So far, I have exhibited six such artworks nationally.
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Jay McClelland

Stanford University

I am a Professor in the Psychology Department and Director of the Center for Mind, Brain and
Computation at Stanford. My research addresses a broad range of topics in cognitive science and
cognitive neuroscience, including perception and perceptual decision making; learning and memory;
language and reading; semantic and mathematical cognition; and cognitive development. I view
cognitive functions as emerging from the parallel, distributed processing activity of neural populations,
with learning occurring through the adaptation of connections among participating neurons, as
discussed in Parallel Distributed Processing (Rumelhart, McClelland, and the PDP Research Group,
1986). Research in my lab revolves around efforts to develop explicit computational models based on
these ideas; to test, refine, and extend the principles embodied in the models; and then to apply the
models to substantive research questions through behavioral experiment, computer simulation, and
mathematical analysis.

Daphna Shohamy

University of Columbia

Daphna founded the Learning Lab at Columbia in 2007. Daphna received a BA from Tel-Aviv University,
double majoring in Psychology and Humanities. She then went on to receive a PhD in Neuroscience from
Rutgers University and trained as a postdoc at Stanford University's Psychology Department. Daphna is
currently an associate professor in the Psychology department at Columbia University. The
interdisciplinary research in the Learning Lab builds on joint efforts of many people, including
undergraduate and graduate students, research assistants, postdocs and collaborators, with expertise
spanning multiple disciplines, including psychology, neuroscience, psychiatry, genetics and computer
science.
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Precios matrícula
RESERVA HASTA 01-05-2019

INVITACION 0 EUR
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Lugar

Palacio Miramar

Pº de Miraconcha nº 48. Donostia / San Sebastián

Gipuzkoa


